
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Sierra/Emery Poleon - North Broward Acceptance 
Date: Mon, 13 Apr 2015 16:30:08 +0000 

personal 

On Mon, Apr 13, 2015 at 12:29 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
please confirm yes is from your personal or do you prefer we pay from STC or LSJE 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

Date: April 11, 2015 at 6:21:11 PM EDT 
Subject: Re: Sierra/Emery Poleon - North Broward Acceptance 
From: "jeffrey E." <eevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn < 

Yes 

On Saturday, April 11, 2015, Richard Kahn < 
Shall I pay from your personal, stc or Lsj 
Please advise. 
Thank you 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Ann Rodriquez
Date: April 11, 2015 at 3:36:22 PM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn
Subject: Fwd: Sierra/Emery Poleon - North Broward Acceptance 

Ann R. 

wrote: 

Begin forwarded message: 
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From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
Date: April 11, 2015 at 3:34:20 PM AST 
To: Ann Rodriquez < Ila> 
Subject: Re: Sierra/Emery Poleon - North Broward Acceptance 

ok 

On Sat, Apr 11, 2015 at 2:04 PM, Ann Rodriquez < IMIla> wrote: 
Hey Bossman, 

North Broward is requesting a $3,000.00 deposit for each child. 
Deposit due $6,000.00 in total 

First installment $26,625.00 for each child should be paid in May. First tuition payment $53,250.00 
in total 

Can be paid with Credit Card or Wire Transfer. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Erik Srnka 
Date: A ril 11 2015 at 1:34:50 PM AST 

To: cas 
Subject: Sierra/Emery Poleon - North Broward Acceptance 

Hello Ann, 

Attached you will find the boarding enrollment agreements for Sierra and Emery at North Broward 
Prep, congratulations! I need page 1 of the attached agreements completed, scanned, and emailed 
back to me along with confirmation that the $3,000.00 deposits ($6,000 total) have been made. 

Once I have received these and the deposit is confirmed we will send the original acceptance letter, 
and the pre-arrival information. Let me be the first to welcome Sierra and Emery to North Broward, 
we look forward to their arrival in the Fall! Let me know if you have any questions. 

Sincerely, 
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Erik Srnka 
Global Admission and Sales Director 

I Morris St. 19'h Floor I New York. NY 10004 
T: Sk 

Important: 

This electronic mail message and any attached files contain information intended for the exclusive use of the individual or entity to whom it is 
addressed and may contain information that is proprietary. privileged. confidential andkir exempt from disclosure under applicable law. 'rya, are not 
the intended recipient, you arc hereby notified that any viewing, copying, disclosure or distribution of this information may be subject to legal 
restriction or sanction. Please notify the sender, by electronic mail or telephone, of any unintended recipients and delete the original message without 
making any copies. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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